EIR FOI and SAR Disclosure Report

Enquiry Reference |Description i [ [ Appeal
Received

\_______

PE\2021\ENQ\43900  EIR - I would like to request a Freedom of Information 05 Oct 2021 27 Oct2021 01 Nov 2021 YES

request for the following:

1. NP/CEC/0521/0515
2. NP/GDO/1020/1003
3. Enforcement 19/0120

There is some urgency given a submission for a judicial
review has a 6 month time limit and 2 months have
already elapsed. Ilook forward to hearing from you.

08/10/2021 Request for clarification.

RESPONSE:
27/10/2021 - Final response, some information provided.
PE\2021\ENQ\44267 EIR - I would like to know how many single storey rear 24 Nov 2021 25 Nov 2021 21 Dec 2021 YES NO

extensions on terraced properties have been approved in
the last 5 years.

I would like to know how many single storey rear
extensions to terraced properties have been rejected due
to the 45 degree rule

And of the rejections how many in the last 4 years have
been rejected by [].



PE\2021\ENQ\43871

PE\2021\ENQ\44363

PE\2021\ENQ\44390

RESPONSE:

25/11/2021 - final response, some information provided.

EIR - Please could you provide me with a list of planning
applications over the two years from 1st April 2019 to
the 1st April 2021 for agricultural needs dwellings within
the Peak District National Park together with information
as to whether each was permitted or refused and
whether the decision was made by the Planning
Committee or under delegated powers?

RESPONSE:
14/10/2021 - Final response - information provided in
full.

25 Sep 2021 14 Oct 2021

FOI - I have noted the wooden gates at both ends of the 13 Dec 2021 15 Dec 2021

Hoo Moor trail were removed on September 24. That
makes access simpler. It would be useful if the two faux
kissing gates could be modified as well, bearing in mind
they do not function as kissing gates and never have.
Thatis a very simple job. I must now formally ask yet
again who insisted on those gates as you claimed, now
as an official Freedom of Information Request. The
public are entitled to know that information, particularly
as it involves public funds. I have slightly modified the
original PDF file on that subject. Copy attached..

RESPONSE:
15/12/2021 - Final response, information provided
including workshop report from 2016.

EIR - I'd like to view an enforcement file. Iappreciate
that the contents are not generally published, but are
you currently letting people into Aldern House to look at
redacted files? I know there is an enforcement file as
I've seen a letter from []! T'll send you a plan if you're
in principle agreeable.

07 Dec 2021 17 Dec 2021

21 Oct 2021 YES

07 Jan 2022 YES

03 Jan 2022 YES

NO

NO

NO



Enforcement Records - 04/0105 and 16/0108.

RESPONSE:
17/12/2021 - redacted copires of files sent via
MailBigFile.
FOI Request ———————
PE\2021\ENQ\44301 FOI - 30 Nov 2021 03 Dec 2021 27 Dec 2021 YES

1. Is your IT estate independent from DEFRA or do you
use their platforms/services?

2. If independent, are you mainly on premise, cloud or a
mixture of both? If both, what is the rough splitin
percentage?

3. What observability or application performance tools do
you use and when are the supplier contracts up for
renewal?

4, How long does it take you to identify problems and
solve them?

5. Who is responsible for IT tooling and how best to get
in contact with them?

6. Do you work with any specific resellers or system
integrators?

RESPONSE:
03/12/2021 - Final response, information provided

PE\2021\ENQ\44283  FOI - Request details of the amount of money that has 26 Nov 2021 07 Dec 2021 23 Dec 2021 YES NO
been committed under Section 106 Planning Obligations
but not spent for the following years: 2017/18, 2018/19,
2019/2020 (and, if available, 2020/21).

RESPONSE:
07/12/2021 - Final response, no information held
meeting request.

PE\2021\ENQ\44066 FOI - Further developments in that a document has been 25 Oct 2021 15 Nov 2021 19 Nov 2021 YES NO




forwarded to me which was cited at the PDNPA Parishes
Day, October 2019.

Reference number ref. TN/A8707 21/11/06. Is that an
in-house PDNPA document or compiled elsewhere?

I would be grateful if you would forward copies of the
following:

1) Peak District Park - National Park (March 1978), Peak
Park Joint Planning Board

2) Peak National Park Plan - First Review (April 1989),
Peak Park Joint Planning Board

Thank you for all your assistance with DHWPC enquiries.
25/10/2021 - request for clarification.

RESPONSE:

15/11/2021 - final response, some information provided.
Copies of area summaries for the Upper Derwent and
Woodlands Valleys taken from the National Park Plan
March 1978, and First Review in April 1989. Unable to
locate the joint study and have suggested that DCC as
the lead partner may have retained a copy.

PE\2021\ENQ\43950 FOI enquiry for our print supplier spend and page usage 11 Oct2021 28 Oct2021 05 Nov 2021 YES NO
levels as now affected by COVID-19.
RESPONSE:
28/10/2021 - Final response - information provided.

PE\2021\ENQ\43565 FOI-1. How many civil servants have made 24 Aug 2021 10 Nov 2021 20 Sep 2021 NO NO

complaints that they have been bullied by another civil
servant/staff member in the last three calendar years (up
to and including August 2021)? To be clear, I'm asking



for information for 2019, 2020 and 2021. Please could
you break this information down by year and gender.

2. How many civil servants/staff have faced civil
service disciplinary investigations as a result of an
accusation of bullying made against them by a civil
servant in the last three calendar years (up to and
including August 2021)? Please could you break this
information down by year, gender. In each case, please
could you state whether any misconduct was found and,
if so, what type of disciplinary action was taken including
verbal/written/final wamings, suspension, dismissal etc.

INITIAL RESPONSE:

31/08/21 - Request for clarification of enquiry
10/11/2021 - Request closed as no further details
provided.

PE\2021\ENQ\44160 FOI - information regarding number of Data protection 05 Nov 2021 19 Nov 2021 02 Dec 2021 YES NO
requests (including subject access requests and other
data subject requests made possible under GDPR)
Freedom of Information and Environmental Information
Regulations

Complaints

Ministerial Correspondence (questions from MPs made
on behalf of their constituents)

Parliamentary Questions (questions raised in parliament
requiring information from you)

Any other official correspondence type, such as
enquiries, feedback or compliments which are logged
and tracked.

Which software application is being used to track these



requests i.e. Excel, Sharepoint, Access or a specific case
management tool - in which case, please state which
one/s. See full request on HUB.

RESPONSE:
19/11/2021 - final response, information provided.

PE\2021\ENQ\44208  FOI - Received via WhatDoTheyKnow. 12 Nov 2021 30 Nov 2021 09 Dec 2021 YES NO
Number of reports made to the PDNPA since 01.01.20
involving injuries received or damage caused to any
person, animal or property directly connected to the
presence of a horse or pony being ridden or lead on a
public bridleway, restricted byway or multi-user trail
within the PDNPA.

RESPONSE:
01/12/2021 - final response, information not held.
PE\2021\ENQ\44207 FOI - Other than the defibrillator that Iam aware is 12 Nov 2021 15 Nov 2021 09 Dec 2021 YES NO

located at Dovedale Car Park, please disclose, preferably
by PDF if you are using an attachment, the (locations,
addresses of) buildings that the authority is aware that
have a defibrillator, how many defibrillators each has and
which of the buildings are open to the general public.

RESPONSE:

15/11/2021 - There are 2 defibrillator sites that we are
aware of - Dove Dale as you have mentioned and also
Millers Dale. Defibrillators were requested for these sites
by first responders who obtained funding for the
installation. Details of the locations of defibrillators can
be found on the Heartsafe website using the following
link: https://www.heartsafe.org.uk/aed-locations. You
can use the plus (+) and minus (-) symbols in the
bottom left corner of the map to zoom in and out to
particular locations and then click on the heart pin to
obtain details of the location such as the AED position,



PE\2021\ENQ\44026

PE\2021\ENQ\43566

model, access availability and local ambulance service.

FOI - Request for Information relating accidents and
complaints re operation of Park Run on the Monsal Trail.
Requst for copy of any risk assessment or similar
documentation that was prepared in advice to evaluate
the health and safety risks arising from the operation of
the Park Run and an explanation as to why this is no
longer appropriate by PDNPA for the safe operation of
the Park Run, along with supporting factual evidence.

RESPONSE:

25/10/2021 - Final response - some information
provided, including a copy of the Park Run National Risk
Assessment and Operating Framework, and 2019 and
2021 Risk assessments for Bakewell.

FOI-1. How many civil servants have made complaints 24 Aug 2021 10 Nov 2021 20 Sep 2021 YES

that they have been sexually harassed by another civil
servant/staff member in the last three calendar years (up
to and including August 2021)? To be clear, I'm asking
for information for 2019, 2020 and 2021. Please could
you break this information down by year and gender.

2. How many civil servants/staff have faced civil
service disciplinary investigations as a result of a sexual
harassment claim made against them by a civil servantin
the last three calendar years (up to and including August
2021)? Please could you break this information down by
year, gender. In each case, please could you state
whether any misconduct was found and, if so, what type
of disciplinary action was taken including
verbal/written/final wamings, suspension, dismissal etc.
3.  Please could you state in any of the cases above
whether the police was notified of the staff member's
sexual harassment complaint/if any investigation/charges

21 Oct 2021 15 Nov 2021 17 Nov 2021 YES

NO

NO



were brought. Please could you break this information
down by year.

INITIAL RESPONSE:

31/08/21 - Request for clarification of enquiry
10/11/2021 - Request closed as no further details
provided.

PE\2021\ENQ\44177 FOI - Cleaning Services - received via WhatDoTheyKnow 09 Nov 2021 02 Dec 2021 06 Dec 2021 YES NO

- Suppliers who applied for inclusion on each
framework/contract and were successful & not successful
at the PQQ & ITT stages.

- Actual spend on this contract/framework (and any sub
lots), from the start of the contract to the current date

- Start date & duration of framework/contract?

- Could you please provide a copy of the service/product
specification given to all bidders for when this contract
was last advertised?

- Is there an extension clause in the
framework(s)/contract(s) and, if so, the duration of the
extension?

- Has a decision been made yet on whether the
framework(s)/contract(s) are being either extended or
renewed?

- Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement)
responsible for this contract?

RESPONSE:
02/12/2021 - final response, information provided.



PE\2021\ENQ\44203 FOI Request - received via WhatDoTheyKnow 12 Nov 2021 19 Nov 2021 09 Dec 2021 YES NO

1. How many malicious emails have been successfully
blocked?

2. What percentage of malicious emails were opened by
staff?

3. What percentage of malicious links in the emails were
clicked on by staff?

4. How many ransomware attacks were blocked by the
department?

5. How many ransomware attacks were successful?

RESPONSE:

19/11/2021 - Final response, some information provided
- inbound mail traffic report, but information exempted
re Q2-5 citing Section 31(1)(a) - prevention and
detection of crime.

PE\2021\ENQ\43885  FOI - I am writing under the Freedom of Information 01 Oct2021 13 Oct2021 28 Oct2021 YES NO
Act, to ask for information about licences for the
following animal-related activities issued by yourselves:
- Dog breeding establishments
- Pet shops
- Dog boarding establishments (commercial)
- Dog boarding establishments (home)
- Cat boarding establishments
- Dog day care establishments.

For each of the calendar years 2015-2020 inclusive, for
each of the above activities please provide:

- Number of first-time licence applications

- Number of renewal licence applications

- Number of applications refused

- Number of one-year licences issued

- Number of two-year licencesissued

- Number of three-year licences issued

- Number of inspections carried out



PE\2021\ENQ\43877

- Number of licences revoked.

If you do not have the information back to 2015 or for
each of these activities, please supply the data where
you do have records.

In addition, for each of the calendar years 2015-2020
inclusive, please also provide:

- Number of animal welfareinspectors

- Number of full-time employees of the animal welfare
team.

Please provide the data in Excel format. A spreadsheet is
attached for convenience.

RESPONSE:
13/102/2021 - Final response - information not held,
please refer to constituent authorities.

FOI - I am looking to obtain a list of every caravan park = 01 Oct 2021 14 Oct 2021
that is licenced in your county and how many caravans

they are licenced for as a business we only wish to trade

with licenced parks, we trade with parks throughout the

UK.

RESPONSE:
14/10/2021 - Final response - information not held, refer
to constituent councils.

28 Oct 2021 YES

NO



